
APPLICATION FOR DAILY TEMPORARY MIXED BEVERAGE PERMIT, DAILY
TEMPORARY PRIVATE CLUB, TEMPORARY LICENSE OR

CHARITABLE AUCTION PERMIT
Temporary Number

FORM L-04.S (12/2007)
A Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage or Private Ciub Permit can only be issued for one day-

Each additions! day requires a separate application.
1. D TB - DAILY TEMPORARY

MIXED BEVERAGE PERMIT
Q Applicant does not hold a Mixed Beverage

OR Permit, then complete sections a, b, and c •*
O Applicant currently hoids:

MB/RM

LB D

OWNER

TRADE
NAME

2. D TN - DAILY TEMPORARY
PRIVATE CLUB PERMIT

N

NE

NB

ML D
TRADE
NAME

a. If the applicant is applying for a Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit and
does not currently hold a Mixed Beverage Permit, complete this section.
Applicant is a;

O political party or association supporting a candidate for public office or a
proposed amendment

D organization formed for specific charitable or civic purpose
D fraternal organization in existence over 5 years with regular membership
D religious organization

b. Organization Name:
Federal Employer's ID # (FEIN): I J

c. State the number of Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permits the applicant has
held beginning January 1 of the current year. The commission shall not issue
more than ten temporary mixed beverage permits in each calendar year to a
person who does not hold a mixed beverage permit, j |

a. if the applicant Is applying for a Daily Temporary Private Ciub Permit, indicate in*
type of organization sponsoring the event indicated in question 10,

D political party or association supporting a candidate for public office or a
proposed amendment

D organization formed for specific charitable or civic purpose
Q fraternal organization in existence over 5 years with regular membership
D religious organization

b, Oraarazation Name;

Federal Employer's ID # (FEIN): ( i
c. State the number of Daily Temporary Private Ciub Permits issued to ths above

organization beginning January 1 of the current year. The commission may not
issue more than two daily temporary private cSub permits in each calendar year
for events sponsored by the same party, association, or organization.
r~ ~~i

A Temporary License may be issued for a period of not more than four days. Each four-day period requires a separate application.
A Special Three-Day Wine and Beer Temporary License is a three-day license. Each three-day period requires a separate application.

A Temporary Charitable Auction Permit is a five-day permit.
3, D BH: TEMPORARY BEER OR WINE AND BEER RETAILER'S PERMIT, four-day permit.

CURRENTLY HOLDS:

MB/RM BG BE LB/BL D

TRADE NAME OWNER

4. D SB: SPECIAL THREE-DAY WINE AND BEER PERMIT

D Nonprofit Charitable Organization D Clvte Organization D Religious Organization

Name of applicant's organization:

Applicant's Federal Employer's Identification #: i i

5. D HP: SPECIAL WINE AND BEER PERMIT, four-day permit, May only be issued to a nonprofit historic preservation organization that has
been in existence for at least 30 years.

Name of nonprofit historic preservation organization;

Date organization was established: / / Applicant's Federal Employer's Identification #: i I

8, B CA: TEMPORARY CHARITABLE AUCTION PERMIT, five-day permit, only ONE allowed per calendar year.

Name of nonprofit organization: Rotary International Space Club of Rotary

Applicant's Federal Employer's Identification #: 74-6070354 |

i.R.S. Form 501{c){3> Exemption must be attached to this application.
Inventory list of alcoholic beverages to be auctioned must be attached to this application.

7, Application is hereby made for the period 1Q/

8. Time(s) of function: 10 AM to 6 PM

1 6 / 0 9 to 1Q/ 1?/ OB both dates included.

9. Location address - fuliy describe location: 5001 NASA Parkway Clear Lake Park Landolt Paviilion

City Seabrook

10. Describe fully the picnic, celebration or similar event for '

County Harris

which the license is requested: Shrimporee food and auction festival

11. !s this privilege to be exercised in an area where the sate of mixed beverages, beer/wine is fegaS? 11. 8 YES NOD
ETC ocwcoec



FORM L-04.5 (12/2007

Contact Name: JERROLD DEWEASE Area Code + Phone Number: (281 ) 488- 4204

Contact Name: JOHN WILSON Area Code + Phone Number: (713 ) 899- 9852

WARNING: Section 101.69 of the Texas Alcoholic Beverage Code states: " . . . a person who makes a false statement or false
representation in an application for a permit or license or in a statement, report, or other instrument to be filed with the Commission and
required to be sworn commits an offense punishable by imprisonment in the penitentiary for not less than 2 nor more than 10 years."

PRINT
NAME: jQhnWilso

SIGN
HERE:

SIGNATURE OF APPLICANT

fc^Ug
&(&

Before me, the undersigned authority, on this
name is signed to the foregoing application personally appeared a
said application and that all the facts therein set forth are true

SIGN

CANT ^ y

l^davof(V^4r^J _,200Q: _ the person whose
;tates under oath t|iat he or she has read the

51A i e ur
My Comm.Exp. 09-27-12 INSTRUCTIONS

This application must be filed directly with the local office of the Texas Alcoholic Beverage Commission in the area where the event
is being held.

2. Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit or Daily Temporary Private Club Permit (TB or TN): Complete the application and make

two copies. Your receipt is your permit. Post it in plain view at the location stated in number 9.
3. Temporary Licenses (BH, SB, HP, CA): Complete the application and make a copy. For a Temporary License associated with a

Mixed Beverage Permit, complete the application and make two copies. In numbers 3 through 6, indicate the class of permit or
license required and complete the appropriate section. All questions regarding the particular temporary license you are applying for
must be answered. Your receipt is your license. Post it in plain view at the location stated in number 9.

4. All applicants must complete numbers 7 through 11. Sign and have your application notarized.
5. See chart below for fees and surcharges that must be paid with a cashier's check, money order, or firm check from corporate

permittee payable to the Comptroller of Public Accounts. We will not accept personal checks.

CLASS OF PERMIT OR LICENSE
Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit (TB)
Daily Temporary Private Club Permit (TN)
Temporary Beer License or Wine and Beer License (4 day) (BH)
Temporary License - Special 3 Day Wine and Beer Permit (SB)
Temporary License - Special Wine and Beer Permit (4 day) (HP)
Temporary License - Charitable Auction Permit (5 day) (CA)

FEES
$50
$50
$30
$30
$30
$25

•SURCHARGE
$171
$192
$171
$171
$171
$171

TOTAL DUE
$221
$242
$201
$201
$201
$196

'SURCHARGE

SUBJECT

TO

ANNUAL
CHANGE

INSTRUCTIONS FOR ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING OF MIXED BEVERAGE TAXES

(FOR A DAILY TEMPORARY PERMIT ISSUED TO A PRIMARY MIXED BEVERAGE OR PRIVATE CLUB PERMIT)

1. Alcoholic beverages sold or served must be purchased separately from those sold or served under the primary Mixed Beverage
Permit or Private Club Registration Permit.

2. After the Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit or Daily Temporary Private Club Permit expires, an inventory of the remaining

alcohol must be prepared. A copy of this inventory shall be retained by the mixed beverage or private dub permit holders and a
copy shall be forwarded to the local office of the Comptroller of Public Accounts. After this inventory is completed, the unused
alcoholic beverages must be transferred to and used by the primary mixed beverage or private dub permittee.

3. For information on reporting the mixed beverage taxes generated under the Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit or Daily

Temporary Private Club Permit and inventory of remaining alcoholic beverages, please contact the local office of the Comptroller of
Public Accounts.

. All laws pertaining to a Private Club Registration Permit or Private Club Exemption Certificate Permit are applicable to a Daily
Temporary Private Club Permit.



Texas Alcoholic Beverage Commission

Approval Form for Temporary License/Permits (If Diagram is
required, Please Complete Back of Form)

Landlord Approval
Date/Time: October 17, 2009 form 10:00am until 6:00pm

Description of event: Space Center Rotary Shrimporee

Address, City & County: Landolt Pavilion. Clear Lake Park. 5001 NASA Parkway.
Seabrook, Texas. Harris County, 77589

Property Owners Name: Harris County Precinct Two

As Landlord of Above mentioned property, I hereby grant permission to
sell/serve alcoholic beverages for the above Event.

LandJqrd's/Signature and date:
&U.

Approval from Law Enforcement Officials from Police
Department/Harris County Sheriff's Department

Approved Yes v No

Signature and Date: P-fuJ

Printed Name/Title/Telephone Number:
/

Precinct 8, Constable Bill Bailey

If Houston Police Department, See Vice Division at 1 200 Travis, 4th Floor,

Houston, Telephone Number 71 3-308-8600. If Location is in Harris County

please contact Harris County Sheriff's Office at 601 Lockwood, Houston, Texas,

Telephone Number is 71 3-967-5770. Wo suggest you call either office to
• ' • ' • - . . •

confirm someone being available.



1 • '• • |i • • • : •-,. f :

HARRIS COUNTY
PRECINCT 2

CLEAR LAKE PARK
5001 NASA ROAD 1

59 ACRES
SYLVIA R. GARCIA
COMMISSIONER

BAY AREA
COMMUNITY CENTER,

SJEARKOFFICE

C L E A R S ^ E L A K E



SPACE CENTER ROTARY SHRIMPOREE
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M/W
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ROOMS

SERVING KITCHEN

HOT DOGS

MEAL TICKETS
$ TICKETS

BIDDERS REGISTRATION
VISITORS SIGN IN

RAFFLE SALES

SHAVED ICE

SOFT DRINKS
BOTTLED WATER

LIVE AUCTION
STAGE AND ITEMS

LIVE AUCTSON SEATING

SJLENT AUCTWN

EATING
SEATING AREA

CHILDRENS' ACTIVITIES

BEER/WINE SALES

SMOOTHiES

SWEET SHOP

N



Internal Revenue S-emce Department of t*?e Treasury

•STAGE CE8TER SQTAEY CLUB
P, 0, BOS 58862
SOUSTQ8, tX 77058

EC5MF' Clerk

(214) 767-1155
Reter FUuJJyfo:

S B81

HIM; 74-6070354

tecerds snessr that Rotary International Space Center Chapter Sotftry
Club is exaspt from ?edar*l iacome tax touier Group Rti-liag So.. 03/3,
g-ection 581 (c) (4) of the la-teraal Kevaaue Cod.&, This, exeffi^ci
granted August 1965 «od reaaias in fall force and effect .

If we -ma? ee of farther' sssistasce-, please e«ata£t the peirsea
.E.em.e te^ -telepftos* maeber ere shos î above.

Sincerely

{j

Ryan



'- ' /*^%i*"-"':"'" " " ' Jb ' S****^^

t Mate of Qmm
L/ • : ' ' • • - • : - - ' '

SECR£TAR Y OF STA TE

CEKTTEICATE OF INCORPORATION
' • . . ; O F - •

THE ROTARY CLV3 Of SPACE CENTER, HOUSTON, TEX4S
CSAKTBK KO,U11423-fll

The naiiersljijed, as Secretary of State of Tens, hereby certiGa thatflns atocli«<J Artidcs
trflaaMTO1*^*18 %^̂ î 6 aiw* named «wponaioa hare been received fat thli office and ore

BlJfGLYfr tfce tttufer^gfted,«? Stapksty o/ State, ami fry Ttrt«e of toe >afl»or!fy
::nttttll£die Secretary l^rlaw, tersi»y fc»o« tMf CerttSeate of licorporatiun.

" ls*oaane of Cbis CeffiflcaM oT JiscorjuaTdtioc do« aat taftorize tUe »» of a corporal? t-«ir:r
s federal Tratenark Art of t':

'tb« TftM* tKuJemaA la«t; Cfca AsRtnsAf "Bndoent or RroffflKiooaJ Name Adt, or th? o»eiaiw

^©V

Sf.ffitafy of Slate



OFINCQRPORAHON

OF ::: :.- ;
; r£

THE ROTARY CU» OF SPACE CENTER, HOUSTON, TEXAS

I, the underjigfjed nateiml person, who is of the »£e of eighteen (18) years or mare,

acting ss irtccrpootor of * corpora&tt under thcTcitf Non-Profn Corpora!JOB Art, da hereby

i&opi the foikwitig ArtkS« of Iqcarporition for sueh coipoafen:
. ^ ' : . ; - • • •'::,.%;?:;>; ."

ARTICLE I
- : ' . - • ; :

r& '.; , : . Name •

The n*roe ef the corpoarioa jfsill be THE KOTAKY CLUB Of SPACE CENTER,

HOUSTON, TEXAS.

ARTICLE n • .

. . . ...
TMi cospamtion i* a iKjct-proflf corpomtion,.

• ARTICLE ,m

period of its duration is perpetual.

ARTICLE IV

Purposes

.The |»«rp37a far wtk i5 i arc t? function RS d1;'-

fedscil fascads, or {Ts^-spcmdLTj: »cs.;.Scn cf any fuiaji fedc.-a/ isx code. : !*3{wJ

slo" shiU no; «rrv or! any othzr uc:i

' - - " - .



permitted » be carried Wi by a rton-profit corporation under the law and s«iutes uf the StsJs

Tetu.

The corporation shslJ Mve jnembers in accordance with its eonsiteiiicw KKt <

ARTICLE VI

Initial Reglrteitd Office and A gent

The imas! addres «f tfce initial «£ist«*d office af ihs corporation is 1300 He

.fioBSKM Texas 711358, and the utm* of ill WOal mfisteicfl î su st such address is B»% IL

SmfiJt"

AKHCLEV1I

Board et Directors

The affsks Of the eorpttratioa !$$& be tnaft^ial bj i Boata of Directors. The

jjaaJiflssfions, jnawier icf seleciioa, Dirties, (enfts, and ofter maltai rslzttng to the Board tsf

nirrctors sMI be j»oviifc<S In (Sis bykws, The initial Botaf of Directors sh»l! consist s»f fi/Jeas

(35) j»«ar«ans. ~A& uumbtr of CirasEars may be inqfia^sd^ «r dssrcasad, by adopiirsr m

ama«)iniei8 of ijyiisws, Ths initial Bosrfl of Plrccfors shaif cousst of ft* fwlteww* acfsse!.- »f

Ss»b«>ok» TX 77586

202 park
Siiaferook, TX 775S6



tamar D. Bowles

J, W, Lowes, m

Bonnie P.

Teny W,

Husy Bwneft

Mchae!

Vtfai R,

Mfchad L, Ponerfieid

Fmni W. Tiytor

Johnny White

14S26 SparMi»i Bay
HOKKOU, TX 77062

J3JB Hcaoiles, Saas 206
Hoodoo, TX 77Q5S

522
Sesbroofc, TX T?S86

443 Stadow

Pasadena, TX 77S82

0t, TX

16411-ion -̂aie

930 Sherewood
Swbrook,' TX 7TJ8S

61S WWieet

1302

723 Seamaste
Houston, TX 7706:*



. / :.;:X. ARTICLE ix :
. '•;.- • :•••!•; " Inceijtowtes

The itante and street addtcti of ttc ineoipacjtor 1$;

B% R,

W:wro>lSS WHEREOF, 1 have.-.benamto let my hsnsj at Ho»ste«, Tesasj this I2t& <ia

1-300 Hersute, Suite 206
Boaster, Tjssas 770»

BSJLY X, SMITH

:



Space Center Rotary
Shrimporee- Silent Auction Alcohol List

1 bottle - Lawson Ranch Merlot
750ml

Black Opal Wines

1 bottle - La Crema Pinot Noir

1 bottle - Lindemarss Cabernet Sauvignon

1 bottle - Brut Champagne

1 bottle - Michael's Celtic Irish Dream
White Chocolate - Irish Cream Liqueur

1 bottle- Sabra
Chocolate Liqueur

1 bottle - Robert Craig Cabernet Sauvignon

1 bottle - Alexander Valley Vineyards
Cabernet Sauvignon

4 bottles* Starbucks Cream Liquor

3 bottles - Absolute Pear Vodka

2 bottles - Strawberry Passion Sweet and Sour Schnapps

1 bottle - Milagro Tequila

1 bottle - Hornitaos Tequila

1 bottle - Jim Beam Bourbon

18 bottles - Liqueur

13.5%

13.9%

13.5%

12.5%

17%

30%

13.5%

750ml

750ml

750ml

750ml

750ml

750ml

750ml

1 liter

750ml

750ml

750ml

750ml

750ml

Box of variety of bottled beer



rT £ X A S
MCOHOUG
•BEVERAGE

-COMMISSION Temporary Permit No.: CA 896576

Form L-77.3
(07/2008)

DAILY TEMPORARY MIXED BEVERAGE
OR PRIVATE CLUB PERMIT

Fee: $25.00 Surcharge: $ 171,00 Tota 1 Fees: $ 196.00 LE File #: 2305849

N/NE/NB/MB/RM No:
Trade Name:
Owner:
City:
County: or
Name of Organization : Rotary International Space Center Chapter Rotary Club

FEIN: 746070354

Date of Function: ]0/i6/2009 - 10/17/2009
Time of Function: 10:00am to 6:00 pm

10:00 am to 6:00 pm

Street Address: 500l NASA PARKWAY, CLEAR LAKE PARK LANDOLTPAV1LLION
City: SEABROOK
County: Harris
Location Description: ROTARY INTERNATIONAL SPACE CENTER CHAPTER ROTARY CLUB
(Diagram, outdoor event, etc.)

Describe Function: Shrimporee Food and Auction Festival

James Murfitt

Printed name of TABC Representative

^

Title

rju^M
Signature of Applicant / Authorized Representative Signature of TABC Representative Issuing Temporary Permit

\J v

POST ORIGINAL SIGNED COPY AT EVENT


