
•7/J -K /? APPLICATION FOR DAILY TEWS
,*,r!i TEMPORARY PRIVATE

CHARiTA

HORARY MIXED BEVERAGE PERMIT, DAILY
: CLUB, TEMPORARY LICENSE OR Temporary Number
3LE AUCTION PERMIT FORM L-04.5 (12/2007)

A Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage or Private C!ub Permit can oniv be issued for one day
I Each additional day requires a separate application
l t d TB- DAILY TEMPORARY

MfXED BEVERAGE PERMIT
D Appftesrt does not hold a Mixed Beverage

OR Permit, then complete sections a, b. and c •»
D Applicant eurrerttiy holds:

IMB/RM
LB D

• OWNER

• TRADE
I NAME

I 2, D TN- DAILY TEMPORARY
PRIVATE CLUB PERMIT

N

NE

UB

NL D
• TRADE

a. if the applteart is applying for a Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit and
does not currently how a Mixed Beverage Permit, complete this section,
Appgcant is a:

D political party or association supporting a candidate for public office or a
proposed amendment

D organization formed for specific charitable or civic purpose
Q fraternal organEStion in existence over 5 years with regular membership
O religious organization

b. Oroanization Name:

Federal Employers ID # (FESN): S }
c. State the number of Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permits the applicant has

held beginning January t of the curr ens year. The eommfsstor* fthaii not issue
more than Ion temporary mixed beverage permits in each calendar year to a
person who does not hold a mixed beverage permit, j J

a. if the applicant ts applying for a Oafly Temporary Private ciwfe Permit, indicate the
type of organization sponsoring the event indicated in question 10,

D political party or association supporting a candidate for pubiic office or a
proposed amendment

D organization formed for specific charitable or civic purpose
D fraternal organisation in existence over S years with regular membersh ĵ
D religious organization

b. Organization Name

Federal Employer's ID f (FEIN): f f
c. State the number of Daily Temporary Private CSub Permits issued to the above

organization beginning January 1 of the current year. The commission may not
issue more than two daily temporary private club permits in each calendar year
for events sponsored by the same party, association, or organization.
1 "1

1 ' 1 1 '
A Temporary License may be issued for a period of not more than four days, tach four-day period requires a separate application.

A Special Three-Day Wine and Be«r Temporary License is a threa-dsy license, Esch three-day per tod requires a separate application,
1 A Temporary Charitable Auction Permit is a five-day permit,

1 3, D BH: TEMPORARY BEER OR WINE AND BEER RETAILER'S PERMIT, tour-day permit,
CURRENTLY HOLDS:

MB/RM BS BE LB/BL D

TRADE NAME OWNER

1 4. S SB: SPECIAL THREE-DAY WINE AND BEER PERMIT
=

B Nonprofit Charitable Organization Q Civic Organization G Religious Organization

Name of applicant's organization; Rotary international Space Center Rotary Club

Applicant's Federal Employer's identification #: i?4-6G7Q3S4 |

1 5, D HP: SPECIAL WINE AND SEER PERMIT, four-day permit. May orrty be issued to a nonprofit historic preservation organization that has
been in existence for at least 30 years.

r-4ame of nonprofit historic preservation organization:

Date oraanlzation was established, / / Applicant's Federal Employer's Identification #: ! 1

1 *. D CA: TEMPORARY CHARITABLE AUCTION PERMIT, five-Asy permit, only ONE a«ow«J per calendar yuar.

Name of nonprofit organization:

Applicant's Federal Employer's Identification #: I 1
I.R.S. Form 501{c}(3) Exemption must toe attached to this application,
Inventory !>st of alcoholic beverages to be auctioned must&e attached to this application.

I 7. AppUcation is hereby made for the period tW

1 8, TiftHHs) of function: 10 AM to 8PM

t® OS to 1(V 17/ 09 both dates included.

1 9, Location address - fully describe location; 5001 NASA Parkway Clear Lake Park, Landoit Pavilion

Cfty S«abfook

•10. Describe fuRy the picnic, celebration or similar event for \

County Harris 77586

¥hfeh the ficense is reauested: Annual Festival and Auetton Shrimpore*

|11, is this privilege to be exercised in an area where the sate of mixed beverages, beer/wine is legal? 11. M YES NO D

r"-»"i»srsi ETC



*-.- * *,*&$. * «.-5*H?r *

Contact Name: JERF?OLO DEWEASE Area Code + Phone Number {281 I 486- 4204

Contact tone: JOHN WiLSQN Ares Code * Pttone Number: |713 > 899- 5852

WARNING: Section 101.69 of the Texas Alcoholic Beverage Code states: * . . . a person who makes a feSse statement or false
representation in an application for a permit or license or in a statement, report, or other instrument to be ffled with the Commission and
required to be sworn commits an offense punishable by imprisonment in the penitentiary tor not less than 2 nor more than 10 years."

PRINT
NAME: Joh

SK3K

SIGNATURE OF APPLICANT

Before me, the undersigned authority, on this I \* / daV of
name is signed to the foregoing application personafiy appearSflind, puiy
said appleafion and that afl the facts therein set forth are true as

*°* IHERE:

feet

the person whose
by me, ̂ ates under oath that lie or she has read tie

NOTARY PUBLIC

fNStRUCTIONS

1.

2.

4.

5.

il* the local office of ttie Tejcas Ateohofic Average Commission in the area where Bie event

is fasting held.

Daily Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit or Daily Temporary Private Club Permit (TS or TN): Complete the application and make

two copies. Your receipt is your permit Post it in plain view at the location stated in number 9.

Temporary Licenses (BH, SB, HP, CAjt Complete the application and make a copy. For a Temporary License associated wih a

Mixed Beverage Permit, complete Ihe application and make two copies, in numbers 3 through 8, indicate the class of permit or

license required and complete the appropriate section. AH questions regarding the particular temporary license you are applying for

must be answered. Your receipt is your license. Post it in piain view at the location stated in number 9.

AJSappJicants must complete numbers /through 11. Sign and have your appiscation notarized.

See chart below for fees and surcharges that must be paid with a cashier's check, money order, or firm check from corporate

permittee payable to 8te CornptoSer of PubUe Accounts. We wffi not accept personal cheeks.

I CLASSO^reRMrTOWl^ENSE

Oa% Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit (TS)
QaHy Terrgsoraf̂  Private Ciub Permit (TN)
Temporary Beer Ucense or WSne and Beer License <4da$ (BH)
Temporary Ucense - Special 3 Day Wine Kid Beer Permit (SB)
Tenjporary License - Specie! Wine and Beer Peimt (4 day) (HP)
Temporary License - Charitable Auttksn Perns? fS day) (CA)

FEES
$50
$50
$30
$38
$30

~SURCHARQE

$171
$132
$17!
S171
$171 j

TOTAL DUE
$221
S242

$201
$2Qf

»W~
125 ! Sf?t i C$W® }

•SURCHARGE

SUBJECT

TO

ANNUAL

CMAMQE

JNSTRUCTIONS FOR ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING OF MIXiD BeVEIS/MSE TAXES

(FOR A DAILY TEMPORARY PERMIT ISSUED TO A PRIMARY MIXED BEVERAGE OR PRWATE CU1B

. Afcohofic beverages sold or served must be purchased separately from those sold or served under the primary MtxM 'Beverage

Permt or Private Club Registration Perrnfe.

. After the Oatty Temporary Mixed Beverage Permit or DaSy Temporary Private Ctab PermS ejqprres, an (twentory of Ihe inornsiniRg

alcohol mu^ be prepared. A copy of tiiis inventory shaii be retained fey the mixed beverage or private dub permit holders and a

copy shafi be forwarded to the tocai office of the Con ĵtoto cf Pubfc Accounte. After this inventory is completed, the untsed

aJoohofc beverages must be transferred to and used by the primary mixed beverage or private ofeib permfttee.

3. For infotma^on on rsporting the mocecf Ijsversge taxes generated untiar th« t)aity Temporary Mixed Beverage Perrrat or Daily

Temporary Private Ciub Permit and inventory of remaining alcohofic beverages, please contact th* local cSos of the Comptfo&r

Pubac Aeeourts.

, AH tews pertaining to a Private Cfub Registration Permit or Private CJub Exemption Certificate Permit are eppficabfe to a i

Temporary Private Ciub Permit



Texas Alcoholic Beverage Commission

Approval Form for Temporary License/Permits (If Diagram is
required, Please Complete Back of Form)

Landlord Approval
Date/Time: October 17. 2009 form 10:00am until 6:00pm

Description of event: Space Center Rotary Shrimporee

Address, City & County: Landolt Pavilion. Clear Lake Park. 5001 NASA Parkway,
Seabrook. Texas, Harris County, 77589

Property Owners Name: Harris County Precinct Two

As Landlord of Above mentioned property, I hereby grant permission to
sell/serve alcoholic beverages for the above Event.

LandJord's/JBignature and date:

Approval from Law Enforcement Officials from Police
Department/Harris County Sheriff's Department

Approved Yes v. No

Signature and Date: _ P4vJ JW^P^— QgV->l-QQi

Printed Name/Title/Telephone Number:

Precinct 8, Constable Bill Bailey
- j.t:

If Houston Police Department, See Vice Division at 1 200 Travis, 4th Floor,

Houston, Telephone Number 71 3-308-8600. If Location is in Harris County

please contact Harris County Sheriff's Office at 601 Lockwood, Houston, Texas,

Telephone Number is 71 3-967-5770. We suggest you call either office to
... - • • , " " ' •

confirm someone being available.



. •

HARRIS COUNTY
PRECINCT 2-

CLEAR LAKE PARK
5001 NASA ROAD 1

59 ACRES
SYLVIA R. GARCIA
COMMISSIONER

BAY AREA
/-COMMUNITY CENTER,

-/—-JJEARK OFFICE
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internal Revenue Serwe ' Department of the Treasury

0; reetc'

Pfjfsof, '<;:Contact:
'SPACE CEifTOl BflTAEY CLUB EOMF Clerk
P <*4 'fVVV '"£"' &*>'7 Tfefe^*1'.--•">£-" f'-.j'- --p-' O-^f '.< V * i>v/-- JQuCJ-A

HCHJSTOJi-, TX 77058 (214) 767-1155

RM;CSB:3-u6:BiR
Oate: F£B 9 ©61

SIS: 74-607035A

records snow- that Rotairy Intemstiosal Spfice Ceat-er Chapter Rotary
Clab is fixaapt I'TOIB Federal iacoiae tax -ander Group Ruling "So.. 0573,
sectloa 561 (c) £4) of the Internal Kevaoue Code, This. «»*?ei08j was

tfed August 1965 -sna rematos iti fall force au-3: effect.grant

If we may be of turther asslstsfic-e., pleese eoKts.ct th« person
irad telepfeone tHS&er ere shown above,

Sincerely yoiirs-,

Eyac



J
SECRETAR Y OF STA TE

rates for the abori
eo&natolawv ,

OF INCORPORATION
• - ( • ' ' O P - - . - - • r . -. : .
1 SPACE C3BSTER, HOUSTON, TEXAS
r£8 NO, 1311422-fil •-",. ; |

*
s OT TKCB, hereby certifies that'the atoned Artiste
WjxjMfion ium> been received fa this office and ore

~-aea>'•'** SecrtSary of SJate, and fcy Tirtae of the Xitbority
Etsry oy Isw, tersiiy kjo« tMf Cfcrttdcate of Incorporation.

F CejUficaJ* of ic rorjjoration does not anthorijc the use of » cateporsbc
i siatt fa rloi^fcc of tots/rigor sf aooibor uadef ths federal Trademark Act oft<«

iradeoiaric Jaw, tiw Aaumed! BtaineK or Professional Name Act, or the VH~*,*«,.

May 12, «94' '

mm
' : '



ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION

OP :; ; ; '• : *
TEE ROTARY CU» OF SPACE CENTER, HOUSTON, TEXAS

I, the undersigned, natural person, who is of the sjs of eighteen (18) yeari- or more.

acting M inecrporticr of t'oorporatfai tmder the T'exts Non-Profn Corpora! Joe Aci, do hcfcbv

adept tte foilcmiag AJlklej of Incwpowtion for sticft corporation:

Name

The n»me-af the KM-pormrioe rtaiJl be THE ROTAKY CLUB OF SPACE CENTER,

' HOUSTON, TEXAS. f':ff. . / /; | "::.. : ;';::

ARTT

ARTICLE ia

Thii<»rponition is a wn

The period erf" in duimkm is perpetual.

.ARTICLE IV

Purposes

.The:parpcsct fiv wtisdj tte ootpoiatlon is orgAaized are to function ts s K'vi'rc cb:.''i •:?;

as' der«s«J in Sadtoa 53![C)(it) of ao !n£«U4l Revenue Code M 1954 or «»•*-,' :
' ' ' ' '

fetes! IK oxJc, •In,1; i»'j«5f! of ».-,y future fcdcra' Ux, code. No'jAricit!;a.'5di«i my

ifcrlsksi of &ca '.ArC'Stt,. .(!•.? a?r,50s!',loA shsi! a^ carry on any ate" ?.ci:na«; :;at



permitted to be esnteJ on by « non-profit ccrporaUon under the law and statutes of the St»{® of

Texas.

AKXICLE V

Members

Hie coipomtion shall have jnembers in aeconJanoe with its esnstattoa sad bytets,

ARBOLEVJ

Initial Rtgittered Offiec Sntf Aj«i![

l%e stfeM tiUtest «f th* -'iniUil î stisried ofli£» of ft* rtajjomtiwi is 1300 Karaites,

:Hotision Texas 77QS8, and {he-name of to iaifial rajpasrs} agent at such addnaa is Bffly R.

Smith.

i ef Uirecfors

The iffj'irs of ths cosporaticBt: shaft be mtoagcd by * Boan£ of OJ«»tors, Tfe

• of sdeeiien, staties, tenns, and olh« mattes regaling to the Bcwrt! of

Directors ihall be peovideS In the byihws. The tettM Baarrf of Directors shall consis »f ffifea»

(15) porsons. Tte jnusber of Dteetars may be incnaneitf «r dcatascsj, by »dopfat« w

ajnesdment of bylaws. The initial Bosrf oflMreciorj stel! consist of 8>e foltewte* pa*»K »r

Acs

775155

I



Lamaf B. Bowles

j, W« l#wes, Ml

Kpooaie 1*»" teteon

Teny :W, Hesstm

H«&y Btmett

JteBaW ft

Mcbaet

Wffitom HvUe

R, Jones

MicfiaeJ t.

Fmnlc W. Ttytor

Johnny While

H 15 Oak Circle
Seabrook, TX 775SS

HE2« Sparkidg Bay
Houaoii, TX 77052

1300 Hercules, Sake 206
Htwitoa,

5SS Starewoad Drtv«
SeJ&rook, TX 775K

443 .Shadow Creek
Ssabrook; TX 775S6

1310
, TX 77582

Grove
Seaturook, TX 77SM

164 1 1 long\'a!e

HoBston, 1X77059

930Shorewood
.' TX 775W

, TX 775M

1302 Woodland
c, TX 77586

723

t; '.-



-

. :J VI ARTICLE IX

^-: '!-- 30corporators

Tte name and stteet «d<fmss of [fee incorparator »$;

8% R, SSitft 1300 Hercules, Suite 206
Houaoa, T

of Way,
W;Wf!NES$ WHEREOF, I have teesnto ss{ my hand-«t Hossiert, Texas, tfrfj !2fb

R, SMITH

• ;
:
'

•ft

",:-.':



T E I, A S
ALCOHOLIC
B E V E R A G E

£COMM!SSION License No.: SB 889400

Form L-154.4
(07/2008)

TEMPORARY LICENSE

Fee: S 30.00 Surcharge: S 171.00 Total Fees: $201.00 LE File #: 2298062

BG/BE No:
Trade Name:
Owner:
City:
County: or

Name of Organization: Rotarv International S0ace Center Rotarv
FEIN: 746070354

The license covers the location described below and authorizes the sale of (.-o 4
Covering the period: 10/16/2009 to 10/17/2009 , both dates inclusive
Time of Function: 10:00 am to 6:00 pm

10:00 am to 6:00 pm

Street Address 500 1 NASA PARKWAY
City: SEABROOK
County: Harris,-
Location Description: NASA PARKWAY, CLEAR LAKE- LANDOLT PAVILLION
(Diagram, outdoor event, etc.) _ ____ _

Describe Function: SHRIMPOREE - FOOD AND AUCTION FESTIVAL

Donny Betts

Printed name of TABC Representative

~

,/
Title

Si gnat arc of Applicant / Authorized Representative Signature of TABjt Representative Issuing Temporary Permit

POST ORIGINAL SIGNED COPY AT EVENT


